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The pilot trainings have begun for Green at You
partners. In May’s newsletter, you can get a
glimpse of how the training is going in each
itinerary.



The Green at You project launched the first edition of its
training itineraries in green employment and
entrepreneurship in Spain, reaffirming its commitment to
providing high-quality and accessible education in the
sector. The initiation event for the training programs took
place on January 31 at the Higher Technical School of
Forestry, Environmental and Rural Engineering of the
Polytechnic University of Madrid (UPM).



During the event, students, teachers, and guests had the
opportunity to experience an initial in-person introduction
to the itineraries through a dialogue about the project,
discussing its objectives, challenges, and potential, as well
as an overview of what their daily experience will be like in
the coming months.



 "An excellent start to our Nature-Based Solutions course!
We're excited to explore how nature can solve urban and
environmental challenges. Our students are already
immersed in practical sessions and enriching discussions.
Onward to a more sustainable future!"



"We’ve kicked off our Sustainable Forest Management
course with great enthusiasm. From management
techniques to biodiversity conservation, every session has
been an opportunity to learn and share experiences. Proud
to contribute to the care of our forests and communities!"



Together with our trainer Leire Díez , we have delved into
key issues such as the functioning of energy markets and
the problem of #energypoverty, providing them with the
necessary tools to face the challenges of the sector.



The Educational Farm operator course has been a valuable
opportunity to explore the connection between sustainable
agriculture and gastronomy.

#FarmToTable #Training #Sustainability #Agriculture
#EthicalFood #Green At You 



Participants of the second edition of the Nature-Based
Solution Operator course, which started on March 4th, are
actively engaging in hands-on learning experiences. This
training provides valuable insights into sustainable
environmental practices and innovative nature-based
solutions.



The online training has been ongoing for both CER and
Forestry Management courses!



The Educational Farm Operator course has started in
Greece with physical workshops in organic gardens, as well
as marketing actions in the headquarters.


